
 

 

Department of Public Works 
7 Court Street, Room 210 

Belmont, New York 14813 
Phone: (585) 268-9230  

 

 
 

 

ALLEGANY COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 
2024 BID PRICES FOR VARIOUS ROAD BUILDING MATERIALS 

PRICES EFFECTIVE MAY 01, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025  
 

 
All materials at the low bid price are available to any Town, Village, School District, or 
Fire District within Allegany County pursuant to Section 103, General Municipal Law. 
 
Per Section 408-a (2) of the County Law and Allegany County Resolution No 202-15, 
all political subdivisions within the state of New York may piggyback off this 
competitive bid as long as both parties mutually agree to it. Responsibility, financial 
or otherwise, for purchase(s) made by other parties due to the extension of this 
contract shall not be by Allegany County. 
 
The determination of the low bid and whether or not the low bidder of any item can 
perform shall be made by the appropriate municipal official and not by Allegany 
County Public Works.  
 
The bid specifications for the various items are on file in the office of the Allegany 
County Department of Public Works in Belmont for review if any Municipalities wish 
to do so for their information. The Allegany County Department of Public Works has 
made available these various building material prices as a service to those 
municipalities wanting to use them. Still, it does not take any responsibility for any 
demands, claims, suits, expenses, or damages arising out of the purchases and 
applications of such materials. 
 
 
Thomas H. Windus, P.E. 
Superintendent 
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Asphalt Concrete- F.O.B.  -   Quantity   0-80 Tons 
Note: F.O.B. prices are awarded to all bidders due to mileage to various work locations  
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Heidelberg Materials Northeast $87.00 $85.00 $82.00 $79.00 $8.00 $0.80 

 

Dolomite- Hornell $76.00 $73.00 $69.00 $68.00 NB NB 

 

Dolomite- Cuba $76.00 $73.00 $69.00 $68.00 NB NB 

 

Asphalt Concrete- F.O.B.  -   Quantity   81-150 Tons 
Note: F.O.B. prices awarded to all bidders due to mileage to various work locations  

 

 

Heidelberg Materials Northeast $87.00 $85.00 $82.00 $79.00 $8.00 $.80 

 

Dolomite- Hornell $76.00 $73.00 $69.00 $68.00 NB NB 

 

Dolomite- Cuba $76.00 $73.00 $69.00 $68.00 NB NB 

 

Asphalt Concrete- F.O.B.  -   Quantity   151-500 Tons 
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Note: F.O.B. prices awarded to all bidders due to mileage to various work locations  
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Heidelberg Materials Northeast $87.00 $85.00 $82.00 $79.00 $8.00 $.80 

 

Dolomite- Hornell $76.00 $73.00 $69.00 $68.00 NB NB 

 

Dolomite- Cuba $76.00 $73.00 $69.00 $68.00 NB NB 

 

 
Asphalt Concrete- F.O.B.  -   Quantity   >500 Tons 
Note: F.O.B. prices awarded to all bidders due to mileage to various work locations  
 
 
 
Heidelberg Materials Northeast 
 

$87.00 $85.00 $82.00 $79.00 $8.00 $.80 

 
 
Dolomite- Hornell 
 

$76.00 $73.00 $69.00 $68.00 NB NB 

 
Dolomite- Cuba 
 

$76.00 $73.00 $69.00 $68.00 NB NB 
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Asphalt Concrete- Miscellaneous in Place  402.098204   9.5 F2 
 

 
 

Location 
 

Quantity in Tons 
 
 

 
Dolomite 

 
Northeast Quadrant 

 
<150  $218.50 

  
151-500  $127.00 

  
>500  $111.00 

 
Northwest Quadrant 

 
<150  $218.50 

  
151-500  $130.00 

  
>500  $113.00 

 
Southeast Quadrant 

 
<150  $218.50 

  
151-500 

 

$127.00 
  

>500 

 

$111.00 
 
Southwest Quadrant 

 
<150 

 

$218.50 
  

151-500 

 

$130.00 
  

>500 

 

$113.00 
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Asphalt Concrete- Miscellaneous in Place  402.128204   12.5 F2 
 

 
 

Location 
 

Quantity in Tons 
  

Dolomite 

 
Northeast Quadrant 

 
<150  $215.50 

  
151-500  $124.00 

  
>500  $108.00 

 
Northwest Quadrant 

 
<150  $215.50 

  
151-500  $128.00 

  
>500  $109.00 

 
Southeast Quadrant 

 
<150  $215.50 

  
151-500  $124.00 

  
>500  $108.00 

 
Southwest Quadrant 

 
<150  $215.50 

  
151-500  $128.00 

  
>500  $109.00 
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Asphalt Concrete- Miscellaneous in Place  402.198904  19 F9 
 

 
 

Location 
 

Quantity in Tons 
 
 

 
Dolomite 

 
Northeast Quadrant 

 
<150  $210.50 

  
151-500  $120.00 

  
>500  $103.00 

 
Northwest Quadrant 

 
<150  $210.50 

  
151-500  $123.00 

  
>500  $106.00 

 
Southeast Quadrant 

 
<150  $210.50 

  
151-500  $120.00 

  
>500  $103.00 

 
Southwest Quadrant 

 
<150  $210.50 

  
151-500  $123.00 

  
>500  $106.00 
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Asphalt Concrete- Miscellaneous in Place  402.258904  25 F9 
 

 
 

Location 
 

Quantity in Tons 
  

Dolomite 

 
Northeast Quadrant 

 
<150  $210.50 

  
151-500  $120.00 

  
>500  $103.00 

 
Northwest Quadrant 

 
<150  $210.50 

  
151-500  $123.00 

  
>500  $106.00 

 
Southeast Quadrant 

 
<150  $210.50 

  
151-500  $120.00 

  
>500  $103.00 

 
Southwest Quadrant 

 
<150  $210.50 

  
151-500  $123.00 

  
>500  $106.00 
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Crane Rental 
 
 

With Operator & Rigger Mansfield Crane Wilcox Crane 

Crane Up to 100 Ton Cap   

Bid Price Per Hour $800 $750 

Bid Price Per Day (10 Hours) $6,400 $6,250 

Bid Price Per Week $23,850 $23,000 

Bid Price Per Month $66,200 $65,750 

   

Crane Up to 150 Ton Cap.   

Bid Price Per Hour $950 $850 

Bid Price Per Day (10 Hours) $7,400 $7,150 

Bid Price Per Week $25,900 $25,000 

Bid Price Per Month $69,100 $67,500 

   

Crane Up to 300 Ton Cap.   

Bid Price Per Hour $1,500 $985 

Bid Price Per Day (10 Hours) $9,100 $8,000 

Bid Price Per Week $30,000 $27,500 

Bid Price Per Month $80,450 $76,750 

   

Crane up to 400 Ton Cap.   

Bid Price Per Hour $1,775 No Bid 

Bid Price Per Day (10 Hours) $13,400 No Bid 

Bid Price Per Week $35,250 No Bid 

Bid Price Per Month $86,500 No Bid 
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GALVANIZED CORRUGATED STEEL BEAM GUIDE RAIL, POSTS, 
BLOCK-OUTS AND BACK-UP PLATES 
 
 
 Chemung 

Supply 
Pavilion 
Drainage 

Galvanized Corrugated “W” Beam Guide Rail:    
12 Gauge, 12’-6” spacing c-c, w/(5) slotted holes for 3’ – 1 
½” 

  

Post spacing.  Including Bolts and Hardware   
   
Straight  $177.00 
10’ Radius  $247.00 
20’ Radius  $247.00 
30’ Radius  $247.00 
40’ Radius  $247.00 
50’ Radius  $247.00 
60’ Radius $233.49  
Terminal Rail   $232.00 
Driveway Terminal Rail (shop curved)  $272.00 

   
Galvanized Corrugated Thrie-Beam Guide Rail:    
12 Gauge, 12’-6” spacing c-c, w/(5) slotted holes for 3’ – 1 
½” 

  

Post spacing.  Including Bolts and Hardware   
   
Straight  $329.00 
10’ Radius  $675.50 
20’ Radius  $675.50 
30’ Radius  $675.50 
40’ Radius  $675.50 
50’ Radius  $675.50 

   
6” x 6” Galvanized Box Beam Guide Railing:   
18’ x 0” Sections: Including bolts, shelf angles, splices 
and hardware 

  

   
Straight $799.80  
10’ Radius $2,125.92  
20’ Radius $1,533.81  
30’ Radius  $1,010.00 
40’ Radius  $1,010.00 
50’ Radius  $1,010.00 

   
W-Beam/Thrie Beam Transition   
6’ – 3” cc w/slots for 3’ – 1 ½” post spacing  $300.00 

GALVANIZED CORRUGATED STEEL BEAM GUIDE RAIL, POSTS, 
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BLOCK-OUTS AND BACK-UP PLATES- continued 
 
 Chemung  

Supply 
Pavilion 
Drainage 

   
Galvanized Box Beam Railing End Assemblies:   

Type I – Including Posts, Bolts & Hardware  $718.00 
   
Galvanized Posts, Including Bolts & Hardware   
   
W6 x 8.5 or W6 x 9, 6’ long (Heavy Post)  $86.50 
W6 x 8.5 or W6x9, 6’ long w/8” x 24” Soil Plate  (Heavy Post)  $125.00 
W6 x 8.5 or W6x9, 7’ long w/8” x 24” Soil Plate (Extra Long 
Heavy Post) 

 
$150.00 

S3 x 5.7, 5’-5” long Universal Weal Post w/Soil Plate  $85.00 
S3 x 5.7, 7’-0” extra- long Universal Weak Post w/Soil Plate  $105.00 
   

Galvanized Blackouts, w/specified hardware:   

W6x8.5 or W6x9, 14” Long $23.67  

W6x8.5 or W6x9, 22” Long  $57.25 
   

Plastic or Synthetic Blockouts, w/specified hardware:   

6” x 7 ¾” x 14” $10.25  

6” x 7 ¾” x 22” $13.67  
   

Galvanized W-Beam Roll Down Mounting Brackets:   

“A/C” Bracket  $68.00 

“B” Bracket  $68.00 
Back-Up Plates (W-Beam) $13.35  
   
Galvanized W-Beam Guide Rail End Sections:   

“Cap at Anchor” Type $62.88  

“Boxing Glove” Type $71.33  
   

Concrete Anchors w/spec’d hardware: $450.00  
   
Box Rail Bridge Posts w/specified hardware:  $617.00 
   
Box Rail Tube Spacers w/specified hardware:  $45.00 
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GALVANIZED CORRUGATED STEEL BEAM GUIDE RAIL, POSTS, 
BLOCK-OUTS AND BACK-UP PLATES- continued 
 
 Chemung  

Supply 
Pavilion 

 Drainage 
   
Box Rail Splice Tube: w/specified hardware   

Type A  $285.00 

Type B  $285.00 

Type C  $285.00 

Type D  $285.00 

Type E  $285.00 

Turn Back $304.76  
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Highway Signs 

GROUP I: 3M SCOTCHLITE DIAMOND GRADE SIGNS Vulcan 

Base Bid #1:  

(A) Aluminum One Side with legend one color $7.41 

(B) Aluminum One Side with legend two colors $7.48 

(C) M Series, 3 Color Routing Marking $9.12 

Base Bid #2:  

Destination Signs $9.12 

Base Bid #3:  

Delineators – reflectorized on Aluminum $1.41 

  

GROUP II: 3M SCOTCHLITE HIGH-INTENSITY SIGNS  

Base Bid #1:  

(A) Aluminum One Side with legend one color $5.78 

(B) Aluminum One Side with legend two colors $5.84 

(C) M Series, 3 Color Routing Marking $7.39 

Base Bid #2:  

Destination Signs – reflectorized on Aluminum $7.39 

Base Bid #3:  

Delineators – reflectorized on Aluminum $1.21 

SIGN BLANKS:  

.080 GAUGE $3.87 

.100 GAUGE $4.81 
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Liquid Bituminous Materials 
 
Liquid Bitumious Materials- Delivered and Applied 
       
   Midland Suit-Kote   
       
NYS  
Designation 

Grade  Bid Price  
Per Gallon 

Bid Price 
Per Gallon 

  

 
Applied- Anionic Emulsions 

    

 
702.20 

 
MC-30 

 
NB NB   

 
702.3001 

 
RS-1 

 
 $3.315   

 
703.3101 

 
RS-2 

 
 $3.365   

 
703.3102 

 
HFRS-2 

 
 $3.365   

 
702.3201 

 
MS-2 

 
 $3.781   

 
702.3301 

 
HFMS-2 

 
 $3.781   

 
702.3401 

 
HFMS-2H 

 
 $3.781   

 
702.3701 

 
HFMS-2P 

 
 $3.635   

 
702.3801 

 
RS-2P 

 
 $3.635   

 
 

  
    

Applied- Cationic Emulsions     
 
702-4201 

 
CMS-2 

 
$3.781    

 
702-4101 

 
CRS-2 

 
$3.365    

 
702-4702 

 
CRS-2P 

 
$3.635    

 
Applied Emulsion Dust Control (AEDC) $2.155 $2.155   
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  Midland Suit-Kote  
Mixing Grades     
(Anionic & Cationic Emulsions)  

 
Bid Price Per 

Gallon  
 
ITEM 702-3201 

 
MS-2 

   

 
Travel Mix Paver 

 
$4.149   

 
Pug Mill & Paver 

 
 $4.431  

 
Pug Mill Only 

 
 $4.081  

 
ITEM 802-3301 

 
HFMS-2    

 
Travel Mix Paver 

 
$4.149   

 
Pug Mill & Paver 

 
 $4.431  

 
Pug Mill Only 

 
 $4.081  

 
ITEM 702-4201 

 
CMS-2    

 
Travel Mix Paver 

 
$4.111   

 
Pug Mill & Paver 

 
 

 
$4.451  

 
Pug Mill Only 

 
$4.081   

 
 

 
HFMS-2GH    

 
Travel Mix Paver 

 
$4.223   

 
Pug Mill & Paver 

 
 $4.501  

 
Pug Mill Only   $4.151  
 
COLD PATCH OIL      
(Mod. CMS-2)  $4.181   
 
(HFMS-2s)   $4.181  
 
(Hyperpatch Oil)  No Bid No Bid  
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Paver Placed Surface Treatment    

 
Bid Price Per Square Yard 

 
Midland 

 

     
Type A- ¼ Inch     

Up to 5000 S.Y.   $8.55  

5000 TO 15000 S.Y.   $6.91  

15001 TO 30000 S.Y.   $6.45  

30001 S.Y. PLUS   $6.36  

     

TYPE B- 3/8 Inch     

Up to 5000 S.Y.   $8.45  

5000 TO 15000 S.Y.   $6.81  

15001 TO 30000 S.Y.   $6.35  

30001 S.Y. PLUS   $6.26  

     

TYPE C- ½ Inch     

Up to 5000 S.Y.   $8.40  

5000 TO 15000 S.Y.   $6.76  

15001 TO 30000 S.Y.   $6.30  

30001 S.Y. PLUS   $6.21  

     

ALLOWABLE DEDUCTIONS- per square yard if Contracting Agency elect to supplement 
operation with their equipment and labor 
     

DEDUCT FOR COMPACTION EQUIPMENT  $0.08  

DEDUCT FOR HAULING  $0.50  

DEDUCT IF HAULING AGENCY 
FURNISHES TRAFFIC CONTROL 

 
$0.22 
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Liquid Bituminous Materials- continued 
 
TYPE 6 DENSE GRADED COLD MIX COURSE AND BITUMINOUS SEAL COAT – IN PLACE 

   SUIT-KOTE 

Type 6 Dense Graded Cold Mix In Place   

 Per Ton  $67.15 
    
Bituminous Seal Coat In Place   
 Per Sq. Yd   $.452 
    
Item 702-3301 HFMS-2 In Place   
 Per Gallon  3.612 
    
TOTAL COST PER SQ YD   
Type 6 Dense Graded Cold Mix   
     PRICE PER TON   $67.15 
     PRICE PER TON X 2000 LB/220/LB/SQ YD  $7.390 
     SEAL COAT PRICE PER SQ. YD.   $.452 
     PRICE PER GALLON  $3.612 
     PRICE PER GALLON X .35 GAL/SQ. YD  $1.264 
     TOTAL COST PER SQUARE YD  $9.103 
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COLD IN-PLACE RECYCLED ASPHALT PAVEMENT 
 
Per Day Unspecified Locations Pavement In-Place Recycling 
Total cost to grind, mix, place, compact RAP, fog seal, maintain traffic, etc. per specs per square 
yard. 
 

  
SUIT-KOTE 

Item Units 
 

3” depth Day $2.460 

   

4” depth Day $2.510 

   
C702.01- Stabilizing Agent Asphalt Emulsion 
(Supplied/Applied/Mixed) 

HFMS-2 GAL $3.475 

   

Supplemental Items   

Add Stone TN $31.50 

Shoulder Milling (1 in to 3 in ) SY $1.060 

Milling (each additional inch) SY $0.25 
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Ready Mix Concrete 
 
 
Concrete Delivered Price Per Cubic Yard  

  Little Lisa  Heidelberg 
Northeast Quadrant     

Concrete Class A:    $200.00 
Concrete Class D:    $200.00 
Concrete Class E:    $200.00 
Concrete Class F:    $200.00 

     
Northwest Quadrant     

Concrete Class A:    $200.00 
Concrete Class D:    $200.00 
Concrete Class E:    $200.00 
Concrete Class F:    $200.00 

     
     

Southeast Quadrant     
Concrete Class A:  $185.50  $192.00 
Concrete Class D:  $189.50  $192.00 
Concrete Class E:  $188.50  $192.00 
Concrete Class F:  $190.25  $192.00 

     
Southwest Quadrant     

Concrete Class A:  $184.50  $192.00 
Concrete Class D:  $189.00  $192.00 
Concrete Class E:  $187.50  $192.00 
Concrete Class F:  $189.50  $192.00 

     
FIBER MESH ADDITIVE PRICE 

ADDITIONAL PER CUBIC YARD   
    

  $12.50  $17.00 
ADMIXTURES 
Price additional per cubic Yard 

    

ASTM Type A:  $7.00  $10.00 
ASTM Type D:  $5.25  $6.00 
ASTM Type F:  $10.00  $12.00 

     
     Small Load Charge  $125.00  $100.00 

     Heated Load Charge  $15.00  $17.00 
     
Months heated load charges apply -   11/15 – 4/15  11/15-4/15 
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Flowable Fill  
 
Concrete Delivered Price Per Cubic Yard 

  Little Lisa Heidelberg 
Northeast Quadrant    

CLSM TYPE “A”:   $175.00 
CLSM TYPE “B”:   $175.00 

Cement Ash Slurry   $175.00 
    
    

Northwest Quadrant    
CLSM TYPE “A”:   $175.00 
CLSM TYPE “B”:   $175.00 

Cement Ash Slurry   $175.00 
     
    
    

Southeast Quadrant    
CLSM TYPE “A”:  $158.00 $175.00 
CLSM TYPE “B”:  $155.75 $175.00 

Cement Ash Slurry   $175.00 
    
    

Southwest Quadrant    
CLSM TYPE “A”:  $157.00 $175.00 
CLSM TYPE “B”:  $154.75 $175.00 

Cement Ash Slurry   $175.00 
    

Small Load Charge  $125/per load $100.00/load 
Heated Load Charge  $15/cy $17.00/cy 

    
Months heated load charges apply:  11/15 – 4/15 11/15 – 4/15 
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Equipment Rental – With an Operator 
 
 Per Hour Per Day Per Week Per Month 
Vibratory Roller- Double Drum     
D&H Excavating $200.00 $1,400.00 $7,000.00 $28,000.00 
Suit-Kote  $2,400.00   
Spallina  $1,425.00 $7,000.00 $27,500.00 
     
Vibratory Roller- Single Drum     
Spallina  $1,425.00 $1,425.00 $1,425.00 
D&H Excavating $200.00 $1,400.00 $7,000.00 $28,000.00 
     
10-12 Ton Tandem Static Roller     
Spallina  $1,425.00 $1,425.00 $1,425.00 
     
10-12 Ton Rubber Tired Roller     
Suit-Kote  $2,200.00   
Midland Asphalt  $2,200.00   
     
Tandem Axle Dump Truck     
D&H Excavating $175.00 $1,250.00   
Spallina $200.00 $1,550.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 
     
Tri Axle Dump Truck     
D&H Excavating $175.00 $1,250.00   
Spallina $200.00 $1,550.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 
     
Water Truck with Pump     
D&H Excavating $175.00 $1,250.00   
Spallina $200.00 $1,550.00 $7,000.00 $28,000.00 
     
Small Milling Machine 
(Raygo 100 or Equal) 

    

D&H Excavating $800.00 $4000.00 $20,000.00  
Donegal Construction (min. 4 hrs/day) $900.00 $4500.00 $20,000.00 $70,000.00 
     
Large Milling Machine 
(Up to 7’ Mill Head) 

    

D&H Excavating $1,000.00 $5,000.00   
Donegal Construction (min. 4 hrs/day) $1,100.00 $5,500.00 $25,000.00 $90,000.00 
Suit-Kote  $5,700.00   
     
Variable width 
Self-propelled Chip Spreader 

    

Suit-Kote  $2,800.00   
Midland Asphalt  $2,800.00   
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Equipment Rental – With an Operator (cont.) 
 
 
 

 
Per Hour 

 
Per Day 

 
Per Week 

 
Per Month 

Asphalt Paver 
Blaw-Knox 200 or Equal 

    

D&H Excavating  $3,600.00 $18,000.00  
Spallina  $3,200.00 $15,800.00 $63,000.00 
     
Road Widener 
Blaw-Knox RW-100B or equal 

    

D&H Excavating  $3,200.00 $16,000.00  
     
Motor Grader 
Cat 120H or Equal 

    

D&H Excavating  $1600.00 $8,000.00  
     
Wheel Loader 3 cu. Yd. capacity     
D&H Excavating  $1,600.00 $18,000.00  
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STEEL 
 
 CHEMUNG SUPPLY 
  
 PRICE/CWT. 

W Shapes up to and including 12 inches  
                      Up to 60’ Long $133.65 

  
W Shapes 14 inches to 36 inches  
                      Up to 60’ Long $133.65 
                      Greater than 60’ Long $153.65 
  
HP Shapes all sized up to and including 14 inches $114.75 
  
C & MC Channels up to and including 18 inches $124.20 
  
Angle, equal and unequal legs, all sizes $132.30 
  
Flat Bar up to and including 6” x 1” inches $120.15 
  
Interlocking Steel Piling  
    PZ-22 $182.25 
    PZ-27 $182.25 
    Special Corners $1,650.00 
  
Steel Sheeting all sizes $185.25 
  
1 3/8” Nom. Diam High Strength All-Thread Road  
         Grade 75, All Thread #11 Rebar  
          25’ or 30’ lengths $781.16 
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MISCELLANEOUS IN PLACE CRACK SEALING 
 
 
  

Sealcoat 
USA 

 
Miscellaneous In-Place Crack Seal- 705.05-01 AC20 & Fiber  

$16.95 
  

 
 
 
 
MISCELLANEOUS IN-PLACE SURFACE TREATMENT 
 
  

Suit-Kote 
 

 

Total Price per Square Yard  
$1.758 

 

 
 
 
 

Rust Preventative Paint 

 

 Sherwin Williams 

RUST PREVENTATIVE PAINT PER GALLON 

John Deere Green Paint 

(Supplied in 5 gallon pails) 

 

$39.78 

# of pails per pallet:  16 

Manufacturer’s Name:  Sherwin Williams 
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Sand and Salt Mix 
 
PRICES PER TON F.O.B. UNLESS SPECIFIED 
 
Sand & Salt Mix New Enterprise 

Alfred Station 
Gernatt Asphalt 

Springville 
3:1 Ratio $35.20 $28.00 
4:1 Ratio $31.50 $25.30 
5:1 Ratio $28.55 $23.50 
6:1 Ratio $27.05 $22.20 
7:1 Ratio $25.90 $21.20 
8:1 Ratio $24.95 $20.50 
9:1 Ratio $24.20 $19.90 

10:1 Ratio $24.05 $19.40 
   

Washed Sand & Salt Mix w/County Salt (F.O.B. Plant)  
5:1 Ratio $13.95 $13.30 

   
   
Washed Sand (F.O.B. Plant)   
     New Enterprise – Alfred Station $7.50  
     D&H Materials $4.00  
     Gernatt- Freedom $6.85  
     Gernatt- Chaffee $5.45  
     Gernatt- Great Valley $7.45  

 
 
 

  

25



 

Used Iron Pipe 
 
Allegany Pipe & Tubular Products 
 

Diameter Wall Thickness Pounds/Lin.Ft. $/Lin. Ft. 

6” 0.250 15.37 $23.50 

20” 0.375 78.67 $114.20 

24” 0.375 94.71 $131.10 

30” 0.375 118.76 $160.33 

36” 0.375 142.81 $197.00 

48” 0.500 253.89 $395.00 

60” 0.500 318.03 $499.00 

72” 0.500 382.17 $560.00 

84” 0.500 446.31 $669.00 

96” 0.500 510.45 $816.00 

120” 0.625 797.57 $1,376.00 

    

Additional sizes   

16” 0.375 62.64 $91.82 

54” 0.500 285.96 $404.00 

90” 0.500 478.38 $725.00 

108” 0.500 574.59 $900.00 

120” 0.750 956.09 $1,529.00 

 
 
 
Giardini Bros. Construction Co., Inc. 
 

Diameter Wall Thickness Pounds/Lin.Ft. $/Lin. Ft. 

12” 3/8” 49.56 $53.00 

18” 3/8” 70.59 $90.00 
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TOWNS WITHIN QUADRANTS 
 
 
 

Northeast Quadrant Northwest Quadrant 
 

Allen Belfast 
Almond Caneadea 
Angelica Centerville 
Birdsall Hume 
Burns New Hudson 

Granger Rushford 
Grover  

West Almond  
  
  
  
  
  

Southeast Quadrant Southwest Quadrant 
  

Alfred Bolivar 
Alma Clarksville 
Amity Cuba 

Andover Friendship 
Independence Genesee 

Scio Wirt 
Ward  

Wellsville  
Willing  
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Vendor Contact List 

 
 

Vendor Phone Fax email 

Behan Farms (716) 801-5329 
 

dvbfarms@hotmail.com 

Chemung Supply (585) 704-5677 (607) 732-5379 mlublin@rochester.rr.com 

County Line Stone (716) 542-5435 (716) 542-5442 melissa@clstone.us 

D&H Excavating/Materials (716) 492-4956 (716) 492-4951 melissa@dhexc.com 

Dolomite Products (607) 324-3636 (607) 324-0998 rmitchell@dolomitegroup.com 

Donegal Construction (724) 423-7500 (724) 423-7501 donegal@donegalconstruction.com 

Gernatt Asphalt Products (716) 532-3371 (716) 532-9000 mdevinney@gernatt.com 

GS Aggregates (716) 532-3371  bills@gernatt.com 

Heidelberg Materials (585) 584-3132 (716) 584-8743 doug.fuess@heidelbergmaterial.com 

JOPO (585) 593-6165 
 

jpotter593@aol.com 

Little Lisa (814) 697-7191 (814) 697-7484 lisa@wayneconcrete.com 

Midland Asphalt (716) 692-0730 (716) 692-0613 tmcnally@midlandasphalt.com 

Pavilion Drainage (585) 584-3261  phil@pavdrain.com 

Rose Gravel Products (607) 742-4004  rosegravelproducts@gmail.com 

Sealcoat USA (914) 439-3186 
  

Sherwin-Williams Paint (240) 350-7862 (732) 842-3050 beniam.tirfe@sherwin.com 

Spallina Materials (585) 657-8001 (585) 657-6575 tkrenzer@spallinamaterials.com 

Suit-Kote (607) 753-1100 (315) 238-7110 mmurphy@suit-kote.com 

Ungermann Excavating (585) 968-1790  cgowiski@gmail.com 

Vulcan Inc. (800) 633-6845 (251) 943-1544 vulcan2@vulcaninc.com  

Wayne Gravel (814) 697-7191 (814) 697-7484 doug@waynepaving.com 

Wilson Dairy (607) 382-7804 
 

rcwilson7130@yahoo.com 
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F.O.B. Plant

Behen Farms 10.00$  10.00$  7.00$    

County Line Stone 13.50$  13.50$  13.50$  21.00$  45.00$  45.00$  75.00$  26.00$  21.50$  24.00$  19.50$   17.50$  17.50$  13.50$  13.50$  

D&H Materials 6.00$    7.50$    16.50$  16.00$  14.50$  14.00$  6.50$    13.00$  6.00$    7.00$    

Dolomite- Bath 30.00$  

Dolomite- Leroy 23.00$  22.00$  13.50$  

Gernatt- Freedom 20.40$  19.85$  20.00$  19.75$  19.75$  19.60$  19.60$  20.65$  

Gernatt- Great Valley 18.95$  19.45$  18.55$  19.45$  19.45$  

Gernatt-Chaffee 12.90$  16.00$  

GS Aggregates 11.85$  11.85$  11.85$  20.40$  19.85$  19.60$  19.60$  12.25$  19.75$  10.45$  13.95$  

Heidelberg 13.50$  13.50$  24.00$  40.00$  70.00$  95.00$  25.00$  25.00$  22.00$  22.00$  25.00$  25.00$  22.00$  22.00$  13.50$  13.50$  13.50$  

JOPO 11.00$  11.00$  10.00$  12.00$  

New Enterprise- Alfred 10.25$  10.25$  13.00$  32.50$  21.50$  16.55$  16.55$  19.50$  19.50$  16.00$  16.55$  16.00$  33.50$  13.00$  32.00$  22.25$  13.00$  

New Enterprise- Franklinville 21.50$  16.75$  16.75$  19.50$  19.50$  16.00$  16.00$  12.50$  29.10$  

New Enterprise- Wehrle 19.00$  46.00$  47.00$  23.50$  20.00$  13.75$  

Rose Gravel 5.50$    

Spallina 10.25$  10.75$  11.75$  20.00$  17.45$  17.45$  16.50$  12.00$  13.50$  15.15$  10.50$  13.25$  

Ungermann Excavating 7.60$    7.60$    7.60$    13.00$  12.60$  12.60$  12.60$  12.60$  12.60$  12.60$  7.60$    10.60$  7.60$    9.00$    

Wayne Gravel 7.80$    7.80$    10.25$  20.50$  6.40$    9.35$    

Wilson Dairy Farm 15.00$  5.00$    8.00$    

NOTE:  F.O.B. Plant prices awarded to all bidders due to mileage to various locations
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Aggregate Bid - Delivered to CR48 Stockpile

Location
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CR 48 Stockpile

County Line Stone 36.00$  61.00$  62.00$  92.00$  30.50$  26.50$  

D&H Materials 15.25$  15.75$  15.25$  16.25$  

Dolomite- Leroy 33.50$  32.50$  

New Enterprise Alfred 23.55$  29.25$  

Ungermann 16.60$  16.60$  22.00$  21.60$  21.60$  21.60$  21.60$  21.60$  21.60$  10.60$  
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Aggregate Bid - Delivered to North East Quadrant and North West Quadrant

Location
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Deliver to North East Quadrant

County Line 36.50$  61.50$  62.50$  92.50$  31.00$  27.00$  

Dolomite- Leroy 33.50$  32.50$  

New Enterprise- Alfred 17.25$  17.25$  23.55$  20.00$  29.25$  

Ungermann 17.60$  23.00$  22.60$  22.60$  22.60$  22.60$  22.60$  22.60$  17.60$  17.60$  19.00$  

Deliver to North West Quadrant

County Line 34.50$  59.50$  60.50$  90.50$  29.00$  25.00$  

Dolomite- Leroy 33.50$  32.50$  

New Enterprise- Alfred 25.05$  30.75$  

Ungermann 15.60$  15.60$  15.60$  21.00$  20.60$  20.60$  20.60$  20.60$  20.60$  20.60$  15.60$  18.60$  15.60$  17.00$  
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Aggregate Bid - Delivered to South East Quadrant and South West Quadrant

Location
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Deliver to South East Quadrant

County Line 65.00$  67.00$  97.00$  34.25$  30.25$  

Dolomite- Leroy 35.50$  34.50$  

New Enterprise- Alfred 39.00$  23.05$  23.05$  22.50$  23.05$  22.50$  19.50$  28.75$  

Ungermann 18.60$  24.00$  23.60$  23.60$  18.60$  

Wayne Gravel 16.65$  16.65$  15.25$  18.20$  

Deliver to South West Quadrant

County Line 37.50$  62.50$  64.50$  94.50$  32.00$  28.00$  

Dolomite- Leroy 34.50$  

Gernatt- Great Valley 29.20$  

New Enterprise- Alfred 24.05$  20.50$  

Ungermann 23.00$  22.60$  22.60$  22.60$  22.60$  22.60$  22.60$  17.60$  

Wayne Gravel 14.55$  14.55$  17.00$  27.25$  13.15$  16.10$  
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